
SpillSmart 2 Drum Bunded Spill Decks are a high quality 
secondary containment bund perfect for use where 
hazardous liquids are handled and stored. Their low 
profile height provide easy access for frequent loading 
and unloading making this also a great choice for 
dispensing  & collecting liquids ensuring drips and 
spills are contained. Made from HDPE they are resilient 
to corrosion, oils. hydrocarbons and strong chemicals.  
With a sump capacity of 120L, batteries and smaller 
containers maybe stored however for storage of 200L 
drums please consider the SpillSmart 2 or 4 Drum 
Bunded Spill Pallet or SpillSmart 4 Drum Inline Bunded 
Spill Pallet Set.  

A removable grate provides quick access for identifying 
leaked fluid and retrieval from the sump. A sump plug 

out let is also featured. The high visibility yellow 

construction of the bund is built tough and is capable of a 
static load of 1300kg and also provides 2 way entry for a 
Forklift or Pallet Jack. Weighing in at just 22kg, these 
nestable SpillSmart 2 Drum Bunded Spill Decks provide 
an economical secondary containment solution, 
complimenting environmental  and OH&S si te 
requirements. Contact your local Envirosmart distributor 
for further information about this product and others in 
our range. 

Designed for:

Ÿ Containing spilt liquids from reaching floors, drains 
and inventory

Ÿ Containing spills and drips whilst transferring, 
collecting or decanting liquids

Ÿ Preventing slips from spilt liquids

Ÿ Easy loading and unloading

Ÿ Economical and practical secondary containment 
solution 

Specifications:

Ÿ 1320x680x300mm (± 5%)Dimensions: 

Ÿ Spill Capacity: 120L

Ÿ Material: HDPE

Ÿ Tare Weight: 22kg (± 5%)

Ÿ Loading Capacity: Static 1300kg / Dynamic 600kg
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